From: "Smith, Samantha" <smithsa@hss.edu>

Date: December 8, 2025 at 3:41:00 PM EST

To: Sharon Dashow <sharondashow@hotmail.com>

Cc: Mary Millman <mszgmm@aol.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] 2025 Hospital for Special Surgery funding request

Dear Sharon,

Thank you so much for this wonderful news and | am pleased to confirm receipt of the funds
from the Eugene S. Zitwer Foundation via wire transfer. We are thrilled to have the
Foundation’s continued support in 2025, which will bring joy and a celebratory atmosphere to
the halls of the HSS Lerner Children’s Pavilion this holiday season.

On behalf of all the children and families we care for at HSS, thank you again!

Best,

SAMANTHA SMITH

Director, Foundation Relations

HSS | Hospital for Special Surgery
535 East 70th Street, New York, NY 10021

TEL (212) 548-2499 CELL (516) 817-3603




From: Sharon Dashow <sharondashow@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, December 5, 2025 11:22 AM

To: Smith, Samantha <smithsa@HSS.EDU>

Cc: Mary Millman <mszgmm@aol.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] 2025 Hospital for Special Surgery funding request

CAUTION: External Email.
Good morning Samantha,

On behalf of the board of The Eugene Zitwer Foundation, | am pleased to inform you that we have granted
the Hospital for Special Surgery’s 2025 holiday funding request. Accordingly,hhas been sent to
you via wire transfer and your bank should receive the funds sometime this morning. Please confirm receipt.

It is our pleasure to partner with you to add some joy during the holiday season to the children you service.
As always, we will need you to provide us with receipts as well as pictures of the holiday party.
Have a wonderful holiday.

All the best,

Sharon

Sharon Weintraub Dashow, Treasurer
The Eugene Zitwer Foundation, Inc.
Sharon Weintraub Dashow

50 Court Street
Suite 702

Brooklyn, NY 11201
718-522-3550 (office)
516-319-4585 (cell)



